TOWN OF CONCORD TOWN BOARD MEETING

May 12, 2011
7:00 p.m.

MEETING CALLED TO ORDER BY GARY A. EPPOLITO, SUPERVISOR.

PRESENT:
GARY A. EPPOLITO, SUPERVISOR



JAMES M. KREZMIEN, COUNCILMAN



PAUL F. SALZLER, COUNCILMAN



WILLIAM F. SNYDER, III, COUNCILMAN



DEBORAH A. KING, COUNCILWOMAN



DENNIS DAINS, HWY SUPT.


ALSO PRESENT:
M. BETH BOLT, TOWN CLERK






DENNIS DAINS, HWY SUPT.






MICHAEL BARONE, TOWN ATTN






JOCELYN BOS, PEOPLE, INC.


OTHERS IN ATTENDANCE – At End of Minutes

INVOCATION DELIVERED BY TOWN CLERK BOLT.  

PLEDGE TO THE FLAG LED BY SUPERVISOR EPPOLITO. 

ITEM #3.  
a)  Supervisor Eppolito acknowledged that there were residents on hydrofracking in attendance.  Ms. Able asked the town attorney if he had spoken with Ben Price, their attorney.  He had not.  Mr. Price was going to be in Gowanda on Sunday.  An invitation was extended to the Board to hear him speak.  Mr. Hoare had a copy of the Planning Board minutes from April where two of their members had attended a session presented by the gas company.  He felt that it was slated towards one opinion.  Mr. Hoare felt that contamination would happen if something was not done soon.
ITEM #1.  
 PEOPLE INC. PRESENTATION 


Supervisor Eppolito noted that Ms. Bos was in attendance to explain People Inc. and the plans for their project.  It is for a 42 unit senior housing complex of 1 bedroom.  Discussion of a senior center in that area is being discussed by the Board.  People Inc. have such complexes in Clarence, Lockport, Buffalo, Hamburg, Cheektowaga, Lackawanna, Akron, North Collins and Wheatfield.  They are purchasing property on Waverly Street of approximately 5 acres.  They have a caretaker on the premises.  Discussion on what was in the units.  It is HUD funded.  The income limits are $22,200 for 1 person and $25,500 for 2 people and 62 years of age.  They had originally planned this for Orchard Park, but they were not given approval by the town.  Supervisor Eppolito noted that it is our gain.   The rent is 30% of the adjusted income and includes heat and water.  There would be a community room and part-time manager who schedule activities.  A van is available on a limited basis.  They hope to start construction in the fall.  Supervisor Eppolito asked about the selection process.  Ms. Bos stated that it is a lottery system if more than 42 people apply.  A waiting list is then started.  Councilman Snyder asked if they decided to build here because there was discussion on building a senior center.  Ms. Bos stated that it did not.  A market study was done and approximately 2100 people who were eligible and income eligible.  It is independent living.  Discussion on what constitutes income.  Mrs. Ginny Krebs, SCENe rep, had visited two of the complexes and was very impressed.  She was very happy that this would be being built.  There is a need.  Mr. George Donhauser asked if it was just for Springville residents.  Ms. Bos stated that about 95% of the residents come from within a 10 mile radius.  Supervisor Eppolito felt that, as this will be located in the village, they should be involved also.  Ms. Bos stated that, at least, 2 of the units would be handicapped accessible.  The unit can be adapted for handicapped also.  Supervisor Eppolito thanked Ms. Bos and she thanked the Board for the opportunity to address them.









May 12, 2011

ITEM #2.
APPROVAL OF MINUTES   

 

a)   Town Board Meeting – 4/14/2011 – Motion by Councilman Krezmien, seconded by Councilman Salzler, to approve the minutes as presented. Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.



Motion by Councilman Krezmien, seconded by Councilwoman King, to approve the minutes as presented. Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.



b)   Bid Opening re: Gravel Bids – 5/2/2011



c)   Bid Opening re: Tree Trimming & Removal – 5/2/2011



ITEM #3.
PUBLIC COMMENT

a)  Mr. George Donhauser asked the town attorney if he had reviewed the

home occupation section of the code.  Supervisor Eppolito and the town attorney have been reviewing and working on this.  They wanted to include retail sales and internet sales, which is not noted in the code.  Mr. Donhauser also asked if the attorney had received any information on the Triple R and Cold Springs Construction mines.  Tn. Attn. Barone noted that Cold Springs should apply for a permit until the land is reclaimed.  Supervisor Eppolito will notify them.  Mrs. Zylinski had paid for the permit but now the land is owned by Gernatt.  It was thought that Gernatt should apply.  Discussion.

 
 
Motion by Councilman Krezmien, seconded by Councilman Salzler, to close Public Comment.  Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.

ITEM #4. 
MONTHLY REPORTS



Motion by Councilman Salzler, seconded by Councilwoman King, to approve the Monthly Reports, Items a-d.  Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.



a)  Code Enforcement Officer/Building Inspector Report

b)  Dog Control Officer  

     

c)  Nutrition Site 


d)  Judge Frank – April 2011
e)  Fire Department- All departments will be working with the community

organizations on their different events; i.e., dairy fest, bike races, running races, etc.
f) Highway Superintendent Report – Supt. Dains reviewed his written

report with the Board.  Supt. Dains and Mark Alianello, engineer, have inspected all the County roads and taken pictures.  Notes were made as to what does and what does not meet the Codes.  Scoby Hill Road takeover was discussed.  
1. Gravel Bids – Supt. Dains had reviewed the bids.  These were

as follows:
     Gernatt          McEwan Trucking  

 Waterman  

Bank Run
 
$5.80

   
    $5.00     

    $4.65      

Screened Gravel

     1"
 
$9.15

          $7.25


    $6.85     

     2"
 
$6.85

   
    $5.75


    $5.25      

     3"      
$6.85

          No Bid                  $5.25      
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     4"      
No Bid
          No Bid     

    $5.25 

Oversize Rock-No more than 10% less than 2” on

  2” to –8”  
$8.90

   
    $8.25   
     
    $7.75

  8” & up   
$40.00
          No Bid                 $55.00 

Crusher Run–2
$8.10


    No Bid                  $8.50

 2”C/R Gravel H.H.$9.65


    No Bid


   $10.75

Screened Top 

   Soil

$19.35                $22.00   
         $20.00
Unscreened

Top Soil    
$13.35
  
    No Bid 
               $15.00   




     

Surge Rock-

Limestone  6”-8” 
$15.75         
    No Bid
               No Bid
#1ACrushed Stone
$18.25

    No Bid

         No Bid

#1 Crushed Stone
No Bid

    No Bid


   No Bid

NOTES:  
  
Gernatt’s - Add $2.00/ton for delivery to town highway garage.

McEwan Trucking – Other bids were:         


Fill    

$2.25/ton


Dirt Fill

$3.00


Gravel Fill

$3.50


Compactable Fill
$4.25


Sel.Str.Fill
$4.50


Screen Dirt Fill
$5.00


1 & 2 Stone

$8.00


1” Stone

$8.50


2” Stone

$8.50

(Prices subject to change without notice.)

Waterman’s Gravel – Add: $3.25 for trucking per ton to the Town of Concord Highway Dept.

  
All prices per ton.  All bids included signed non-collusion statements.

Supt. Dains was recommending awarding the bids as follows:


Waterman Gravel Products – Bank run gravel






   Screened gravel 1”,2”,3” and 4”




                           Oversize rock 2” to 8”

Gernatt Asphalt Products – Oversize rock 8” and up

                                                            Crusher run gravel - -2” and -2”


                                                Surge rock-limestone 6” to 8”

                                                            Screened and unscreened topsoil

Motion by Councilman Krezmien, seconded by Councilman Salzler, to award the bids as recommended above by the Highway Superintendent.  Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.

2. Tree Trimming & Removal Bids – Three sealed bids had been

received.  They were as follows:

Tree Removal Cost
Cost per diameter inch measured at 4” above existing Grade.  Cost includes all operations of cutting, removal, grinding and restoration

as noted in Item #2, in “Information for Bidders”.




St. Matthews
Good Neighbor
Tree Services
  





Service

of WNY, LLC

Quantity

1400 dia.in


1 Year Bid Price
  $29.00

$17.50

$23.00

Total


  $40,600.00
$24,500.00

$32,200.00
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2 Year Bid Price
  $30.00

$17.50

$24.00

Total      

  $42,000.00
$24,500.00 

$33,600.00
Tree Trimming Cost  

Cost per hour for a crew as itemized in Item #3 in the “Information for Bidders”.




St. Matthews
Good Neighbor
Tree Services
  





Service

of WNY, LLC

Quantity

100 hours


1 Year Bid Price
  $100.00

$80.00

$135.00

Total


  $10,000.00
$8,000.00

$13,500.00

2 Year Bid Price
  $105.00

$80.00

$150.00

Total      

  $10,500.00
$8,000.00 

$15,000.00
Total 1 

Year Bid Price
  $50,600.00
$32,500.00

$45,700.00

Total 2 

Year Bid Price
  $52,500.00
$32,500.00

$48,600.00

All bids included signed non-collusion statements.

Supt. Dains was recommending awarding the bid to Good Neighbor Tree

Service for two (2) years in the amount of $24,500 (tree removal) and $32,500 (tree trimming).    Motion by Councilman Krezmien, seconded by Councilman Snyder, to award the tree removal and trimming bid to Good Neighbor Tree Service for the above pricing, as recommended by the Highway Superintendent.  Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.

3)  Cornell Highway School in June – Motion by Councilman Krezmien,

seconded by Councilwoman King, to grant permission to the Highway Superintendent to attend the highway school at Cornell this June.  It is a budgeted item.  Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.

4)  Supt. Dains stated that he had received notice from FEMA on the

Craneridge repairs.  The cost was originally $261,336.24.  Final review by FEMA has been completed and they have made the final payment of $207,822.74.  The final project cost was $53,513.50 under the initial projection costs.  There is a software program but it is expensive.  Discussion on maybe sharing the program and costs between counties and towns.
5)  Supt. Dains had received a concern from a Craneridge resident on an

erosion issue with her pipes in the sewer system.  It is the town’s responsibility.  He noted that it is an individual’s responsibility to file for FEMA.  This could have helped those residents.

6)  Supt. Dains asked the Board’s permission to again roll the firemen’s

park.  This has been done in the past.  This will not be done on town time.  Motion by Councilwoman King, seconded by Councilman Salzler, to authorize the highway superintendent to roll the firemen’s park grounds, not on town time.  Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.



Supervisor Eppolito wanted to publicly thank Supt. Dains for all his hard work on the FEMA project.  Also, for repairing the town hall and library parking lots.
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Motion by Councilman Krezmien, seconded by Councilman Salzler, to receive and file his reports.  Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.

ITEM 5. 
NEW BUSINESS

a) Audit of the Bills.  Supervisor Eppolito stated that these bills were 

audited by Councilman Salzler, and reviewed by the Board. 



General Fund A, abstract 5, bills 447-511 & 577-580


General Fund B, abstract 5, bills 512-520


Library Fund, abstract 5, bills 521-525


Fire Protection, abstract 5, bill 526


Joint Van, abstract 5, bills 527-529


Joint Youth, abstract 5, bills 530-532


Craneridge Lighting, abstract 5, bill 533


Craneridge Sewer, abstract 5, bills 534-541
Highway DA, abstract 5, None



Highway DB, abstract 5, bills 542-571


Kissing Bridge Water, abstract 5, bill 572


Kissing Bridge Sewer, abstract 5, bill 573


Trevett Rd. Water, abstract 5, bill 574


Trust & Agency, abstract 5, bills  575-576


Capital, abstract 5, None


Motion made by Councilman Salzler, seconded by Councilwoman King, to approve the bills as presented.  Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.

b) Authorize Payment to Waste Management for the 2011 Spring

Trash Pickup (After Completed) prior to the June Meeting  - Motion by Councilman Salzler, seconded by Councilwoman King, to authorize payment to Waste Management for the 2011 Spring Trash Pickup (after completed) prior to the June Meeting.  They did a very good job.  Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.


Supervisor Eppolito stated that he would like to re-bid the fall pickup in August.  It would be the same “A” bid.  The Board was in agreement.
c) Sign Up for 2011 Concert Series  -  Supervisor Eppolito asked the

Board members to sign up for the concerts in the park.  He was going to try and see if it rains, they would be held in the Art Center.  It would be more convenient.  
d) Manaher use to Town Hall – A letter had been sent to the Board

requesting use of the town hall for tutoring special needs children.  Supervisor Eppolito had spoken with her and she does charge for this.  She had used the conference room on a limited basis last year.  Town Clerk Bolt noted that she had not been aware that Ms. Manaher had been charging her students.  Ms. Manaher had said it would be a maximum of 30 days.  It would have to be on an availability basis.  The Board did not want to set a precedent by not charging a rental fee.  Supervisor Eppolito suggested a $50 rental fee for the summer.  Discussion ensured.  Tn. Attn. Barone asked about insurance coverage.

Supervisor Eppolito will check with our insurance consultant.  Motion by Councilman Snyder, seconded by Councilwoman King, to allow Mary Manaher the use of the conference room for tutoring, when available, for a $50 rental fee, contingent upon proper insurance coverage.  Councilwoman King noted that special needs children do need the continuity of schooling over the summer.  Roll call vote was called.
Councilwoman King – Aye; Councilman Krezmien – Aye; Councilman Salzler – Nay;

Councilman Snyder – Aye; Supervisor Eppolito – Aye.  Motion carried.
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e) Assessor Petition – Discussion has taken place during the work
session.  Discussion continued on when a vote would take place.  Robin Sion was in attendance, who works for the Board of Elections, and informed the Board that a vote could not occur at the primary election.  It would have to be on the November ballot.
Councilman Snyder moved to accept the petitions filed with the town clerk to have the change of an elected assessor to an appointed assessor put on the November ballot, seconded by Councilwoman King.
Voting as follows:


Councilwoman King

Aye


Councilman Krezmien
Nay


Councilman Salzler

Aye


Councilman Snyder

Aye


Supervisor Eppolito

Aye



Discussion on the next steps that have to be taken.  This will have to be reviewed.
ITEM # 6.
OLD BUSINESS

​

There was no old business.



ITEM #7.
CONSENT AGENDA  
a) State of NY DOT
b) State of NY DOT Scoby Hill Road

c) 4/12/11 Minutes WNY Dairy/Ag Festival

d) 4/25/11 Minutes Southtowns Planning/Development Group

Motion made by Councilman Salzler, seconded by Councilman Snyder,

to accept the Consent Agenda, Item a-d.  Councilwoman King; Councilmen Krezmien, Salzler & Snyder; Supervisor Eppolito, voting aye.  Carried.

ITEM #8.
EXECUTIVE SESSION


None was required.

ITEM #9.
COUNCILMAN NOTES

a)  Councilman Salzler stated that he rode a motocycle and just west of

Belscher Road on Route 39 where they have milled the road out and left some of the milling groves.  It throws the rider off.  Supt. Dains stated that it was his understanding that Cold Springs is back working on this.  Remediation has to be done on the old section of 219 and over on Zoar Valley Road and Rt 39 and Belscher.  South Buffalo Street was also included in milling.
b)  Words had been exchanged between the town attorney and

Councilman Snyder during the work session.  The town attorney had taken a negative attitude and Councilman Snyder felt he was due an apology.  The town attorney had apologized when the exchange took place and he apologized again.  He stated that he had never done it before and he would never do it again.  Councilman Snyder accepted his apology.

c)  Councilwoman King informed the Board that her and the town clerk

would be joining with another team for the Relay for Life.  Supervisor Eppolito’s wife had made a quilt and they were donating it to the team.  It will be displayed at Witter-Davis.
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d)  Councilman Krezmien wanted to thank Councilman Snyder for his
help with getting the gas company to repair the town hall lawn that they had dug up when there was a gas leak.

e)  Councilman Krezmien asked about the intersection of North St.,

Buffalo Road and Sharp Street.  Supervisor Eppolito had written letters but nothing has been done to date.  Supt. Dains had been asked to lower the snow banks during winter this past year because visibility was bad.  A 5-eay stop sign was discussed.  The Board did not want to see an accident happen.  The supervisor will send out another letter to the County highway department.

f)  Supervisor Eppolito noted that the hazardous drug drop-off the end of
April.  Collection was 170 lbs.  
g)  Supervisor Eppolito informed the Board that a public hearing was

held by the IDA on the proposed ice rink.  That Board approved the tax breaks for 7 years, if they choose to take them.  Funding is through a private corporation.  The project cost is approximately $6,000,000.00.  It will be a sports complex-hockey, volleyball, soccer, etc.  There is a start date for the fall.  

h)  Supervisor Eppolito noted that he is doing a presentation on the IDA

for the Chamber with one of the IDA executives.  There may be another project coming.

ITEM #10.
MOTION TO ADJOURN


Motion by Councilwoman King, seconded by Councilman Salzler, to adjourn the meeting at 8:50 p.m. in memory of:



Patricia Nowak


Mary Lou Frank





_______________________________________________





M. Beth Bolt

